

IFB #621 Cutting Edges 2018

2018 Cutting edges, blades and bits tabulation										
To be delivered to Routt County Oak Creek Shop District 1 , 24500 CR 27, Oak Creek, Colorado 80467										
Supplier							Volk Manufacturing Co.			DMC W
Qty	Thickness	Width (inches)	Length (feet)	Punch Size	Description	Application	Brand	Unit Price	Total Price	Brand
200				0.88"	Large Grading Carbide Bits (W/Ring) BCC87KCSBSR	GRADER	No bid		\$0.00	ITR
2	1	6	4	3/4"	48" Kennametal Style board, 28bit 3/4 holes 2100-48-34 D1D (BC2100-48-34)	GRADER	No bid		\$0.00	Valley Blades
2	1	6	3	3/4"	36" Kennametal Style board, 21 bit 3/4 holes 2100-36-34 D1D (BC2100-36-34)	GRADER	No bid		\$0.00	Valley Blades
Sub Total for Shop 1									\$0.00	
To be delivered to Routt County Hayden Shop District 2 , 38000 CR 53, Hayden, Colorado 81639										
Supplier										
Qty	Thickness	Width (inches)	Length (feet)	Punch Size	Description	Application	Brand	Unit Price	Total Price	Brand
100	3/4"	8	7	5/8	Curved moldboard	140H Grader	Valk	\$112.00	\$11,200.00	ITR
100	3/4"	8	7	3/4"	Curved moldboard Black cat part #(BC7T1625-6)	140M Grader	Valk	\$112.00	\$11,200.00	ITR
50	3/4"	6	4	3/4"	Carbide (Black Cat part # CIAT664844)	Plow truck	No bid		\$0.00	Valley Blades
50	3/4"	6	3	3/4"	Carbide (Black Cat part #CIAT663644)	Plow Truck	No bid		\$0.00	Valley Blades
10	3/4"	8	2	5/8"	Extension (Black cat part # 3G2165)	Grader	No bid		\$0.00	Valley Blades
10	3/4"	8	2	3/4"	Extension (Black cat part # BCT66708)	Grader	No bid		\$0.00	Valley Blades
Freight to Shop 2									\$0.00	
Sub Total for Shop 2									\$22,400.00	
To be delivered to Routt County Steamboat Springs Shop District 3 , 2300 County Shop Road, Steamboat Springs, Colorado 80487										
Supplier										
Qty	Thick-ness	Width (inches)	Length (feet)	Punch Size	Description	Application	Brand	Unit Price	Total Price	Brand
100	3/4 "	8	7	3/4	Curved moldboard Black cat part #(BC7T1625-6)	grader	Valk	\$112.00	\$11,200.00	ITR
200				0.88"	Large Grading Carbide Bits (W/Ring) BCC87KCSBSR	grader	No Bid		\$0.00	ITR
2	3/4"	6	4	3/4	48" Kennametal Style board, 28bit 3/4 holes 2100-48-34 D1D (BC2100-48-34)	grader	No Bid		\$0.00	Valley Blades
2	3/4"	6	3	3/4	36" Kennametal Style board, 21 bit 3/4 holes 2100-36-34 D1D (BC2100-36-34)	grader	No Bid		\$0.00	Valley Blades
Freight to Shop 3									\$0.00	
Sub Total for Shop 3									\$11,200.00	
Grand Total for Shops 1, 2, and 3									\$33,600.00	

OAK CREEK extra inventory	#	
4' carbide insters 3/4" punch		52