

RFP 770 ATTACHMENT A - Bristle and Cutting Edge Response Tabulation

To be delivered to Yampa Valley Regional Airport, 11005 RCR 51A, Hayden, Colorado 81639-1060

Supplier							MB Cpmpany			United Rotary			Myslik			Sherwin Industries			
Qty	Broom Head Size (feet)	Core Size	Rows per Core	Bristle Type	Description	Application	Brand	Unit Price	Total Price	Brand	Unit Price	Total Price	Brand	Unit Price	Total Price	Brand	Unit Price	Total Price	
2	18'	8'10"	28	Wire	Split Core Broom Head 4618 Cassette Refill Kit URB# 29-CW265224	MB RUNWAY BROOM	MB 907-1979 32	\$8,099.23	\$16,198.46	URB	\$6,200.00	\$12,400.00	SIB	\$6,856.00	\$13,712.00	SIB	\$6,900.00	\$13,800.00	
168	18'	8'10"		Wire	Flat Wafer Refill, 46" URB# 05-191460WWAH	MB RUNWAY BROOM	MB 101-9210 9	\$38.06	\$6,394.08	URB	\$33.80	\$5,678.40	No Bid		\$0.00	No Bid		\$0.00	
168	18'	8'10"		Poly	Flat Wafer Refill, 46" URB# 05-191460PWA	MB RUNWAY BROOM	MB 101-1371 32	\$25.45	\$4,275.60	URB	\$22.55	\$3,788.40	No Bid		\$0.00	No Bid		\$0.00	
336	18'	8'10"		Spacer Rings	Spacer Rings Refill, For 46" Wafers. URB# 05-SPACER1912	MB RUNWAY BROOM	MB 402-9431 4	\$3.10	\$1,041.60	URB	\$3.75	\$1,260.00	No Bid		\$0.00	No Bid		\$0.00	
4 Boxes				Conv Poly Wafer	Wafers Refill, 10" x 32" URB# 04-100320PC24	BOBCAT	MB	\$336.00	\$1,344.00	URB	\$221.00	\$884.00	No Bid		\$0.00	No Bid		\$0.00	
3 Boxes				Conv Wire Wafer	Wafers Refill, 10" x 32" URB# 09-100320WC24	BOBCAT	MB	\$360.00	\$1,080.00	URB	\$266.50	\$799.50	No Bid		\$0.00	No Bid		\$0.00	
1 Boxes				Flat Poly Wafer	Wafers Refill, 10" x 32" URB# 01-100320PW28	BOBCAT	MB	\$308.00	\$308.00	URB	\$262.00	\$262.00	No Bid		\$0.00	No Bid		\$0.00	
Freight to YVRA																			
Sub Total for YVRA									\$30,641.74			\$25,072.30			\$13,712.00	Incomplete		\$13,800.00	Incomplete